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Registration Form 

Name                              

Address                         

City, State, Zip                        

Day: Phone                     Fax                      

Email ______________________________________ 

AARC #                          

  

Portions of the NCSRC Symposium may be photographed and 

audio/video recorded. By attendance or in discussion, the  

attendee agrees that the NCSRC or any Sponsor may  

photograph, record, copy, and distribute the attendee's name, 

photograph, or recording use for publicity and/or promotional 

purposes.  

 

 
Signature 

Mail your registration to: 

NCSRC Inc. 
PO Box 1038 

Carolina Beach, NC 28428 
For additional information, email: ncsrc@ncsrc.org  

call 336-757-2247  

Educational Objective:  

Quarterly Education Meeting 2016, is  
presented by the North Carolina Society for 
Respiratory Care to advance the science, 
technology, ethics and art of respiratory care 
by providing an educational program of  
exceptional quality for respiratory care  
practitioners and students, physicians, and 
other health care providers.   
 

Course Description:  
Quarterly Education Meeting 2016 is a  
continuing educational program for  
respiratory care practitioners.  A distinguished 
faculty, comprised of therapists, will present 
lectures on a variety of topics that should be 
of interest to every respiratory care provider.  
The Quarterly Education Meeting is also the 
venue for the NCSRC Board of Director’s 
Meeting.  
 

Continuing Education Credit:  

This program has been approved for a  
maximum of 3 contact hours of Category I 
CRCE (continuing education) credits by the 
American Association for Respiratory Care.  
[Programs approved for  continuing education 
credit by the AARC are accepted by the North 
Carolina Respiratory Care Board.]  
Course # 145472000 

 
CUTOFF DATE FOR REGISTRATION:     
 
Monday, May 30, 2016 
 

Registration Fee: $30 (non-AARC Members) 

  Free (AARC Members) 

Capacity: 115 people 

Seating priority: RCP’s (Members before non-Members) 

  Students   

 



Friday, June 10, 2016 

9:00 - 10:00 ECMO: Current Trends,  

  Future Trends, and Case  

  Reviews 

  Lindsey Kreisher, BA, RRT, RCP 

10:00-11:00 Using Airway Graphics to  

  Optimize Patient-Ventilator  

  Synchrony 

  John Davies, MA, RRT, RCP, FAARC 

11:00-12:00 RT Case Presentations 

  Neil R. MacIntyre, MD, FAARC, FCCP 

 
12:00 - 1:00 Lunch (on your own) 
 

1:00 - 5:00 Board of Director’s Meeting 
  (Open to all members) 

North Carolina Society for Respiratory Care, Inc. 

Quarterly Education Meeting 2016      

 Program 


